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Attached is an email communication sent to Staff from Hydro-Resources, Inc. in response to

Staffs Engineering Recommendation (2) discussing the cost of automatic fire pump control system

modification costs.

IN THE MATTER OF THE APPLICATION OF
HYDRO-RESOURCES, INC. FOR A RATE
INCREASE.

COMMISSIONERS
DOUG LITTLE -- Chairman
BOB STUMP
BOB BURNS
TOM FORESE
ANDY TOBIN

RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED this 6th day of May 2016.

Arizona Corporation cow I
x̀

J § aD W

BEFORE THE ARIZONA CORPORATION COMMISSIUN

\

s-
my.l};§, iii*

» -1
!'*.a.. ,

Y
\.. ""

Fa f

""x g g l

g s ,,,. n
r

,-...

20

DOCKET NO. W-20770A-16-0020

STAFF'S NOTICE OF FILING

lHI1lll1lllllllllll llll
60001 701 60

17
MAY 66 2Gfi8

18

; r ,
ROllin R. Mitchell, Attorney
Legal Division
Arizona Corporation Commission
1200 West Washington Street
Phoenix, Arizona 85007
(602) 542-3402
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Original and thirteen (13) copies
of the foregoing filed this
6th day of May 2016 with:
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Docket Control
Arizona Corporation Commission
1200 West Washington Street
Phoenix, Arizona 85007
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Rodney Ort
Quarles & Brady LLP
Two North Central Avenue

5 One Renaissance Square
Phoenix, Arizona 85004

6 rwott@bryancave.corn

1 Copy of the foregoing emailed this
6th day of May 2016 and mailed on

2 The 9th day of May, 2006 to:
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John Rueter
801 South State Route 64
Space 100
Williams, Arizona 86406
john@jwrueter.com
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The following was a communication between Staff and the Company in regards to fire pump automatic
control systems modifications.

Michael Thompson initially had a phone conversation with Mr. Rueter, Wednesday morning, May 4th

Hello Mr. Rueter, regarding the fire pump automatic control system modification, the Utility Division

Director would like to know the total estimated cost associated with its installation. Would you be able

to provide that information to me by this afternoon? l'm not certain, but the costs associated with the
fire pump control system may be included in the rate case.

Mr. Rueter responded via email with the following:

-----Original Message-----
From: John Rueter
Sent: Wednesday, May 04, 2016 2:11 PM
To: Michael Thompson
Subject: Fire pump automatic start modifications

Hello Mike,
In response to your question concerning the modification to allow remote and automatic operation of
the Hydro-Resources fire pump in Tusayan, we estimate a total $14,580.00 at this time for completion of
all work.
This will include running communications wire from Hwy 64 up to the fire pump and tank site, technician
costs, excavation and installation of a pressure sensing device and control box on the 8' waterline at the
electrical panel at the bottom of the hill, and a visible warning light along with remote alarms for both
Hydro Resources staff and the local fire department.

Should you have any further questions don't hesitate to call.
Kind Regards,
John Rueter
President
Hydro Resources Inc.
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