
From: 

To: 
Subject: 

Patricia Olsen <patsy@montezumawater.com> b- @I2 SctA- 12- 6zos 
Wednesday, March 12,2014 7:29 PM 10r~W5L1A-  12-6206 
Pierce-Web; Burns-Web; Stump-Web; RBurns-Web; Bittersmith-Web 
Re: 006-0796680-901; Montezuma Rimrock Water Company 

.Sent: 

Attachments: SKMBT~36314031110180.pdf w4Jy25y4-12 -6207 
&)-- 042SVA- U-DL3 
w- 6 W z s c C A ~ 0 g ~ W  
w4q2SYA- 04;-6%2 

ORIGINAL 
Dear Commissioners, 
Attached is the statement from the leasing company regarding the arsenic treatment facility. The 
arsenic treatment facility has been operating for over a year and we still have no funding to pay for 
the system. An order or recommendation still has yet to be submitted. The hearings were in June, 
201 3. 

H.R. 3258, "The Drinking Water System Security Act of 2009" 
Title II of H.R. 2868 (formerly H.R. 3258) replaces Section 1433 of the Safe Drinking Water Act to 
strengthen security at drinking water facilities to prevent an intentional act that causes a chemical 
release, contaminates the water supply, or otherwise disrupts the ability of a water system to provide 
a safe and reliable supply of drinking water. 

Sincerely, 

atricia Olsen, President Arizona Corporation Commission 
q o n t e z u m a  Rimrock Water Co. U C  D TED 

3031 €. Beaver Creek Rd., Rimrock, A Z  86335 
928-592-9211 MAR 1 3  2014 
htt~://www. mon tezumawater. com/ 

----- Forwarded Message ----- 
From: Jennifer Bisson cjbisson@finDac.com> 
To: "patsv@ montezumawater.com" cIsatsvQ montezumawater.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, March 11,201 4 1 1  :19 AM 
Subject: 006-0796680-901 

Please see the attached notice regarding our equipment. 

Jennifer Bisson 
Portfolio Services Representative 
Phone: 253-568-6222 
Fax: 253-568-2222 
jbisson@finuac.com 
3455 S .  344" Way Ste. 300 
Federal Way, WA 98001 

A subsidiary of Umpqua Bank 
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Financial Pacific Leasinge 
A subsidiary of Umpqua Bank 

3455 S. 344th Way, Ste 300 
Federal Way, WA 98001 
Phone: 253.568.6000 
Fax: 253.568.2222 
finpacWnpac.com 
www.finpac.com 

March 11, 2014 

PATRICIA AND GREGORY OLSEN 
MONTEZUMA RIMROCK WATER COMPANY LL 
4599 E GOLDMINE RD 
RIMROCK AZ 86335 

RE: Lease #0796680-001 / MONTEZUMA RIMROCK WATER COMPANY LL 

PATRICIA AND GREGORY OLSEN; 

This letter will serve as notification that Financial Pacific 
Leasing has not received the past due amount of $1,654.34. Your 
failure to respond, forces Financial Pacific Leasing to declare the 
entire lease payments and all other sums immediately due and 
payable. The amount due will be $47,781.92 if the lease is 
accelerated and Financial Pacific Leasing proceeds with the 
repossession of the equipment. 

If you wish to prevent the acceleration of this lease and remain on 
a monthly payment arrangement, an immediate payment of 
$2,824.80 is required. Your lease is being reviewed for further 
action at this time due to the seriousness of the delinquency. 

Notify Financial Pacific Leasing immediately of your intentions by 
calling Toll Free 1-877-222-8558, ext 222. 

Our acceptance of the above amount or any amounts due under the 
lease shall not be construed as a waiver of any rights under the 
lease or any guarantee. The aforementioned amounts will be 
credited against the entire amount due under the lease. 

Sincerely, 

Jennifer Bisson 
Collection Department 

http://finpacWnpac.com
http://www.finpac.com

