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From: Qaliuia r(ennedy

Sent: Wednesday, December 14, 2011 9:16 PM ) o o
To: Katherine Nutt Arizana Corporation Commission
Subject: FW: ARIZONA AMERICAN WATER DOCKETFP

DEC 15 720m

Send to Consumer services and docket

————— Original Message-----

From: Gregory schmidt [mailto:pregfest@netins.net]
Sent: Wednesday, December 14, 2011 5:35 PM

To: Pierce-Web

Cc: Gary Pierce; Kennedy-Web; Sandra Kennedy; Newman-Web; Paul Newman; Stump-Web; Bob Stump;
Burns-Web; Brenda Burns

Subject: ARIZONA AMERICAN WATER

Commissioners -

I am contacting you about an incident that has grown quite substantial in regards to how the
Arizona American Water utility communicates with their clients, when there are water loss
issues.

In August (while we were up north in Iowa) our water line to the refrigerator ice-maker
burst and filled our Sun City patio home with 3" of water and continued to run for 3 weeks.
At those temperatures it brought on a mold situation - that the insurance company would not
cover. To date - the accident has cost us $5300 in mold removal, and the insurance company
nearly $90,000. *Everything in the house was affected.

When I contacted the water company's office to ask them why they didn't inform us of the
water loss issue - even though our monthly water bill had spiked 8 times its normal use - he
brushed me off with the statement that our account hadn't reached a "threshold" high enough
to warrant an alert. AND that when they do give out alerts IT'S DONE AS A NOTE IN THE NEXT
MONTH'S BILLING !?!?!

I would like to request that you seriously look at enforcing Arizona American Water to
establish a better warning system when there are spikes in water use (especially during the
summers when so many of the homes are unoccupied).

I'm sorry that I did not take the time to request a vote "no" on the SW Gas price
increase; but I will put in my request to hold APS fee levels where they are now.

Sincerely,

Gregory Schmidt

13801 N. 107th Dr.

Sun City, AZ. 85351
(641) 357-5177
*Account #23-0197566-6




