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Grant, Michael M.

From: Tara Williams [Tara.Williams@azag.gov]

Sent: Friday, April 10, 2009 8:06 AM

To: Grant, Michael M.

Cc: Robin Mitchell

Subject: Re: Paragraph 4 of Procedural Order--San Manuel Interconnect--Siting Case No. 142

Thank you, Mr. Grant. I will forward the hotel information to the Committee Members.

Thank you,

Tara Williams

Assistant

Consumer Protection & Advocacy Section
Office of the Attorney General

Tel: (602) 542-7759

Fax: (602) 542-4377
tara.willliams@azag.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole
use of the intended recipient (s) and may contain confidential and privileged information.
Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies
of the original message.

>>> "Grant, Michael M." <MMG@gknet.com> 4/10/2009 7:04 AM >>>

Tara: As required by paragraph 4 of the April 8, 2009 Procedural Order, SWTC has
discussed this matter with Michael Kearns and agreed to reimburse the Line Siting Fund if
the expenses of the proceeding exceed the application fee. It is also my understanding
that Committee members' expenses will be covered at the hearing hotel and Mr. Kearns
invited your call if you had any questions concerning that subject.

Your assistance on these matters is appreciated. Mike

Michael M. Grant

Gallagher & Kennedy, P.A.
2575 E. Camelback Road
Suite 1100

Phoenix, Arizona 85016

Phone: 602-530-8291

Fax: 602-530-8500

E-mail: mmg@gknet.com <mailto:mmg@gknet.com> Web site: www.gknet.com
<http://www.gknet.com/>

Attorney Profile <http://www.gknet.com/attorneyprofile.aspx?id=55>

This message and any of the attached documents contain information from the law firm
of Gallagher & Kennedy, P.A. that may be confidential and/or privileged. If you are not
the intended recipient, you may not read, copy, distribute, or use this information, and
no privilege has been waived by your inadvertent receipt. If you have received this
transmission in error, please notify the sender by reply e-mail and then delete this
message. Thank you.



Grant, Michael M.

From: Grant, Michael M.

Sent: Thursday, April 09, 2009 4:12 PM

To: 'Tara Williams'; Robin Mitchell

Cc: Marta Hetzer; Susan Ellis; Pearsall, Peri L.
Subject: RE: #142 Procedural Order

Agreed. I just wasn't sure what the last words were. Thanks, Mike

Michael M. Grant

Gallagher & Kennedy, P.A.
2575 E. Camelback Road
Suite 1100

Phoenix, Arizona 85016

Phone: 602-530-8291
Fax: 602-530-8500
E-mail: mmg@gknet.com
Web site: www.gknet.com

Attorney Profile

This message and any of the attached documents contain information from the law firm
of Gallagher & Kennedy, P.A. that may be confidential and/or privileged. If you are not
the intended recipient, you may not read, copy, distribute, or use this information, and
no privilege has been waived by your inadvertent receipt. If you have received this
transmission in error, please notify the sender by reply e-mail and then delete this
message. Thank you.

————— Original Message-----

From: Tara Williams [mailto:Tara.Williams@azag.gov]
Sent: Thursday, April 09, 2009 4:12 PM

To: Robin Mitchell; Grant, Michael M.

Cc: Marta Hetzer; Susan Ellis; Pearsall, Peri L.
Subject: RE: #142 Procedural Order

Mr. Grant,

Thank you for your response. I have brought the error to the Chairman's attention, and he
does not believe it is necessary to correct at this time. What is missing is "if needed,
additional public comment sessions on dates and at times to be determined later." The
Chairman will send out a new Procedural Order if additional public comment sessions are
needed.

Thank you,

Tara Williams

Assistant

Consumer Protection & Advocacy Section
Office of the Attorney General

Tel: (602) 542-7759

Fax: (602) 542-4377
tara.willliams@azag.gov



CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole
use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential and privileged information.
Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies
of the original message.

>>> "Grant, Michael M." <MMG@gknet.com> 4/9/2009 3:53 PM >>>

Tara: I noticed that a line or lines seem to have been dropped at page 2, line 2 of the
Procedural Order. The last sentence stops with "and,

if". Mike

Michael M. Grant

Gallagher & Kennedy, P.A.
2575 E. Camelback Road
Suite 1100

Phoenix, Arizona 85016

Phone: 602-530-8291
Fax: 602-530-8500
E-mail: mmg@gknet.com
Web site: www.gknet.com

Attorney Profile

This message and any of the attached documents contain information from the law firm
of Gallagher & Kennedy, P.A. that may be confidential and/or privileged. If you are not
the intended recipient, you may not read, copy, distribute, or use this information, and
no privilege has been waived by your inadvertent receipt. If you have received this
transmission in error, please notify the sender by reply e-mail and then delete this
message. Thank you.

————— Original Message-----

From: Tara Williams [mailto:Tara.Williams@azag.gov]
Sent: Thursday, April 09, 20092 11:07 AM

To: Robin Mitchell; Grant, Michael M.

Cc: Marta Hetzer; Susan Ellis; Pearsall, Peri L.
Subject: #142 Procedural Order

I have attached the Procedural Order filed yesterday with Docket Control.

Thank you,

Tara Williams

Assistant

Consumer Protection & Advocacy Section
Office of the Attorney General

Tel: (602) 542-7759

Fax: (602) 542-4377
tara.willliams@azag.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole
use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential and privileged information.
Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies
of the original message.



